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2022 NON-NOMAR REALTOR® MLS Fee Schedule 

REALTOR® MLS MEMBERSHIP – Every REALTOR® must file an application to join the MLS once the principal Broker has joined and pay the appropriate 
fees. 

*Agent MLS dues are pro-rated quarterly and NON-REFUNDABLE. 
 

Non-NOMAR  
REALTORS® 

Pro-rated 
Annual MLS 

Dues 

One-time MLS 
Security Fee Total 

2022 January 
                  

80.00  6.95 86.95 

2022 February 
                  

80.00  6.95 86.95 

2022 March 
                  

80.00  6.95 86.95 

2022 April 
                  

80.00  6.95 86.95 

2022 May 
                  

80.00 6.95 86.95 

2022 June 
                  

80.00  6.95 86.95 

2022 July 320.00  6.95 326.95 

2022 August 
                  

320.00  6.95 326.95 

2022 September 
                  

320.00 6.95 326.95 

2022 October 
                 

240.00  6.95 246.95 

2022 November    240.00  6.95 246.95 

2022 December 
                  

240.00 6.95 246.95 

Beginning May 1, 2021, agent MLS fees will 
be billed quarterly.  Fees for the quarter that 
starts July 1st will be invoiced on May 1st, due 
on June 1st and delinquent on July 1st.  
Accounts paid after June 30th will incur a 
$25.00 delinquent fee that is due with 
payment.  On July 1st, the User’s MLS 
Services will be deactivated for nonpayment.   
 
Fees for the quarter that starts on Oct 1st will 
be invoiced on August 1st, due on September 
1st and delinquent on October 1st.  Accounts 
paid after September 30th will incur a $25.00 
delinquent fee that is due with payment.  On 
October 1st, the User’s MLS Services will be 
deactivated for nonpayment.  
 
Fees for the quarter that starts on January 1st 
will be invoiced on November 1st, due on 
December 1st and delinquent on January 1st.  
Accounts paid after December 31st will incur a 
$25.00 delinquent fee that is due with 
payment.  On January 1st, the User’s MLS 
Services will be deactivated for nonpayment. 
 
Fees for the quarter that starts on April 1st will 
be invoiced on February 1st, due on March 1st 
and delinquent on April 1st.  Accounts paid 
after March 31st will incur a $25.00 delinquent 
fee that is due with payment.  On April 1st, the 
User’s MLS Services will be deactivated for 
nonpayment. 
 




